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A. FALL SPORTS EQUIPMENT (DELIVERY BY 08-04-23)
Item # Units Item Description Vendor Bid Price Units Brand Order #

1 Case
Tape 
[32 per case]

1.5" x 15 yd Mueller 84940[NO 
SUBS]

School Health $68.70 32/CS MUELLER 28287

2 Case
Instant Ice Packs
[16 per case]

6" x 9" School Health $12.50 16/CS SCHOOL HEALTH 37271

3 Box
Band-Aids 
[100 per box]

1 inch  - FABRIC Medco $3.14 100/Box Dukal 317265

4 Box Band-Aids Extra Large - FABRIC Medco $3.76 50/Box Dukal

6 Box
Gauze Pads 
[100 per box]

3 Inch - Indv. Wrapped Medco $5.39 100/Box Dukal 35260

9 Each Footballs (Game)
Wilson GST 1003
[As specified or equal - sample 
required if bidding equal]

Pyramid $90.99 EA WILSON F1003B

10 Each Football Girdle
Football Girdle 5 pocket with 
pads sewn in

Pyramid $18.89 EA CHAMPRO FPGU18A

11 Pair
Football Practice 
Pants

Rawlings Adult Football 
Practice Pants
#11936MK - [PO will indicate 
size]

Riddell $10.65 Riddell RPPPC

12 Each
Soccer Balls 
(Game)

Brine International #32 Size: 5 
Hand Stitched 
[NO SUBS]

Pyramid $24.89 EA BRINE

PHANTOM 
#SBPHTMX7 

**INTERNATIONAL 
WAS 

DISCONTINUED IN 
2015**

13 Each Soccer Balls

Select Royale Soccer Ball [As 
Specified]
[compares to Brine NCAA 
Championship Ball]

Mobile Sports $39.89 Select Royal

14 Each Soccer Balls

Select Numero 10 Soccer Ball 
[As Specified]
[compares to International 32 
from Brine]

Mobile Sports $32.89 Select Numero 
10

15 Doz
Soccer/Field 
Hockey Tube Socks

Twin City FSH  P.O. will specify 
color
[NO SUBS] - [sold in pairs in 
doz.]

Pyramid $4.89 PAIR TWIN CITY FSH10

16 Each Ball Bags
1/4" Mesh Only-45" Martin 
#BBG X-Large

Quill $9.87 24" x 36" Each Martin Sports JV34498

17 Doz.
Field Hockey Balls 
(Game)

Penn Monto #PFM700 
[NO SUBS] - PO will state Color

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 Box
Non-Latex Gloves 
[500 box]

Surgical - non Latex, Size: Large
[Vendor specify brand]

Pyramid $4.99 BX/100 HOSPECO VPF236

21 Box
Non-Latex Gloves 
[500 box]

Surgical - non Latex, Size: 
Medium
[Vendor specify brand]

Pyramid $4.99 BX/100 HOSPECO VPF235

22 Each Score Books
Soccer  Scorebook - Brine [No 
Subs]

Pyramid $6.89 EA KWIK GOAL

20B601 **BRINE 
SCOREBOOK WAS 
DISCONTINUED IN 

2019**
23 Each Score Books Field Hockey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 Each Volleyballs Practice Balls - Tachikara Pyramid $16.99 EA TACHIKARA SV18S

French River Education Center - Co-op Bid
2023-2024 Athletic Supplies Winning Bids
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B. WINTER SPORTS EQUIPMENT (DELIVERY BY 11-03-23)
Item # Units Item Description Vendor Bid Price Units Brand Order #

26 Each Basketballs (Game)

Spalding TF1000ZK Microfiber 
Pro 
[As specified or equal - sample 
required if bidding equal]

Pyramid $58.95 EA SPALDING PRECISION #775248

27 Each Basketballs (Game)
Spalding TF1000 Legacy
[As specified or equal - sample 
required if bidding equal]

Pyramid $59.95 EA SPALDING 768138

28 Each
Girls Basketball 
(Game)

Spalding TF1000ZK Microfiber 
Pro 28.5 
[NO SUBS]

Pyramid $58.95 EA SPALDING PRECISION #775238

29 Pair Basketball Nets
Carron #AWN Whipless 
Basketball Nets  [NO SUBS]

Pyramid $18.99 PAIR CARRON AWN (10201)

30 Each Score Books Basketball - Mark V  [NO SUBS] Medco $5.99 Each Cramer 77060

C. SPRING SPORTS EQUIPMENT (DELIVERY BY 03-01-24)
Item # Units Item Description Vendor Bid Price Units Brand Order #

31 Case
Tennis Balls 
[72 per case]

Wilson WT 1001    (yellow-
extra duty)

Mobile Sports $76.48 min 10 cases (120 
cans)

Wilson WT1001

Alternative Mobile Sports $76.48 min 6 cases (72 cans) Penn Champ WT1001

32 Doz. Baseballs (Game)
Diamond D-1Pro - Raised Seam 
[As specified or equal - sample 
required if bidding equal]

Riddell $102.35 DOZEN Diamond D1-PRO HS

33 Doz. Baseballs (Game)
Wilson 1010 
[As specified or equal - sample 
required if bidding equal]

Pyramid $79.95 DOZEN WILSON A1010BHS1SST

34 Doz. Baseballs (Practice)
National/American - League 
Ball

Pyramid $48.99 DOZEN CHAMPION OLB1 **OFFICIAL 
LEAGUE**

35 Doz. Softball (Game)
Dudley SB12 Yellow w/red 
stitching [NO SUBS]

Pyramid $78.98 DOZEN DUDLEY 4H311Y

36 Each Score Books Baseball/Scoremaster Pyramid $3.89 EA PETERSON SCOREMASTER #7SB1

37 Each Score Books Softball/Scoremaster Pyramid $3.89 EA PETERSON SCOREMASTER #7SB1
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